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• Based on the gaps identified in 
the existing system and the 
client’s new strategy, a strategy 
map with related measures, 
targets and initiatives 
associated with it was 
developed for the client

• A BSC audit was conducted
with all members of the client
organization, to gauge the
maturity of their existing
performance management
process

• The client’s strategy was
translated into an
implementable solution using
the strategy map and BSC
Framework

• This included development of
the objectives and measures,
assigning weightages to these,
setting of targets, development
of strategy narrative and
measures dictionary

• The client was the telecom and 
IT regulatory and promotion 
body of a GCC member country

• The client required support in 
developing and implementing a 
new strategy and five year plan 
using the Balanced Score Card 
(BSC) Framework
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